



**BAC RESOLUTION**  
**No. 2019-0079**

WHEREAS, pursuant to Purchase Request No. 2019-06-0429 a Public bidding for the Procurement of various Drugs and Medicines (IB 2019-008) was conducted in accordance with the RA 9184 and its IRR;

WHEREAS, the Invitation to Bid (IB) was advertised and posted in the PHILGEPS website for the period of June 12 to July 3, 2019 with Reference No. 6248210;

WHEREAS, a Pre-Bid Conference was held on June 21, 2019, 10:00 am at the Training Room of San Lorenzo Ruiz Women's Hospital with three (3) prospective bidders attended namely **APPLIED PHARMA, PHIL PHARMAWEALTH and FILADAMS**;

WHEREAS, deadline of submission and opening of bids is on July 03, 2019, 10:00 am at SLRWH Training room and Three (3) prospective bidder procured the bidding documents, All Prospective bidder submitted their respective proposal namely **APPLIED PHARMA, PHIL PHARMAWEALTH and FILADAMS**;

WHEREAS, the first envelope containing the eligibility and Technical Documents were individually opened. The presence, completeness and correctness of the required documents were checked and verified by the HBAC in the presence of the prospective bidders representative after which, all bidders were declared **"ELIGIBLE"**;

WHEREAS, the second envelope, containing the Financial Documents was opened, the presence, completeness and correctness of all the documents were checked and verified by the HBAC, upon examination, all eligible bidder are rated **"PASSED"**.

Subsequently, their bid proposal was read and posted in the Abstract of Bids;

Name of Company				APPLIED PHARMA	PHIL PHARMAWEALTH	FILADAMS PHARMA
	Item Description	Quantity	Unit	ABC		
1	Acetylcysteine, 200mg sachet	500	sachet	5,095.00	NO BID	NO BID
2	Acetylcysteine, 100mg sachet	200	sachet	1,760.00	NO BID	NO BID
3	Acetylcysteine 600mg effervescent tablet	5000	effervescent tablet	136,700.00	NO BID	NO BID
4	Aluminum Hydroxide+ Mg Hydroxide, 225mg+200mg/ 5ml, 120ml suspension	200	bottle	6,158.00	NO BID	NO BID
5	Amoxicillin, 500mg	10000	tab/cap	13,200.00	NO BID	NO BID
6	Amoxicillin, 250mg/5ml, granules/powder for suspension, 60ml	100	bottle	1,788.00	NO BID	NO BID
7	Ampicillin sodium, 500mg	10000	amp/vial	87,300.00	NO BID	BEYOND ABC
8	Ampicillin 500mg+sulfactam 250mg (as sodium salt)	100	amp/vial	2,474.00	NO BID	BEYOND ABC
9	Atropine sulfate, 1mg/ml, 1ml	100	ampule	762.00	NO BID	BEYOND ABC



Republic of the Philippines  
Department of Health-Metro Manila Center for Health Development  
**SAN LORENZO RUIZ WOMEN'S HOSPITAL**  
O. Reyes St., Santulan, Malabon City  
Tel. No. (02) 294-4853 / 294-4854 Website: www.slrwh.doh.gov.ph  
PHIHealth Accredited Facility



10	Ascorbic acid, 500mg	2000	tab/cap	1,360.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
11	Aspirin, 80mg	1500	tab/cap	1,290.00	NO BID	1,185.00	NO BID
12	Atorvastatin 40mg	3000	tab/cap	41,250.00	NO BID	NO BID	18,000.00
13	BUDESONIDE 250mcg/ml, 2ml unit dose	2000	nebule	58,720.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
14	Cefalexin, 500mg	10000	tab/cap	22,700.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
15	Ceftazidime, 1g	300	amp/vial	11,772.00	11,700.00	11,292.00	NO BID
16	Cefotaxime 500mg	100	amp/vial	5,212.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
17	Cefuroxime 500mg	10000	tab/cap	99,000.00	99,000.00	94,200.00	NO BID
18	Cefuroxime 125mg/5ml, 70ml granules for suspension	50	bottle	9,452.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
19	Cetirizine 5mg/5ml syrup, 30ml	100	bottle	7,095.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
20	Cinnarizine 25mg tab	3000	tab/cap	3,300.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,650.00
21	Co-Amoxiclav ( Amoxicillin + Potassium Clavulanate ) 500mg+ 125mg	5000	tab/cap	43,550.00	43,500.00	NO BID	NO BID
22	Co-Amoxiclav ( Amoxicillin + Potassium Clavulanate ) 400mg+ 57mg/5ml, 70ml, suspension	50	bottle	9,900.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
23	Clopidogrel 75mg	2000	tab/cap	4,160.00	3,900.00	2,680.00	3,900.00
24	Clindamycin 300mg	500	tab/cap	2,890.00	NO BID	NO BID	2,750.00
25	Dobutamine 50mg/ml, 5ml	30	amp/vial	5,008.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
26	Doxycycline 100mg	1000	tab/cap	1,080.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
27	Domperidone 1mg/ml, 60ml suspension	30	bottle	3,531.00	NO BID	NO BID	1,765.50
28	Enoxaparin 100mg /ml, 0.6 ml	100	pre-filled syringe	32,080.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
29	Ephedrine sulfate, 50mg/ml, 1ml	300	ampule	20,049.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
30	Epoetin alfa (recombinant human erythropoietin) 1000 IU/0.4 ml, pre-filled syringe	100	pre-filled syringe	40,832.00	40,800.00	36,400.00	NO BID
31	Fondaparinux 2.5mg/0.5ml solution	50	pre-filled syringe	61,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
32	Isosorbide Dinitrate 1mg/ml, 10ml	200	ampule	90,368.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
33	Insulin Regular, Recombinant DNA, Human 100 IU/ml, 10ml	100	amp/vial	17,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID



Republic of the Philippines  
Department of Health-Metro Manila Center for Health Development  
**SAN LORENZO RUIZ WOMEN'S HOSPITAL**  
O. Reyes St., Santulan, Malabon City  
Tel. No. (02) 294-4853 / 294-4854 Website: www.slwrh.doh.gov.ph  
PhilHealth Accredited Facility



34	Insulin, Biphasic Isophane Human Insulin 70/30 (rhumabinsulin DNA) 70% isophane suspension + 30% soluble insulin 100IU/ml, 10ml	100	amp/vial	17,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
35	Isoxsuprine HCL 10mg	1000	tab/cap	4,660.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
36	Ketorolac 30mg/ml, 1ml	2500	amp	44,300.00	NO BID	38,350.00	NO BID
37	Lidocaine 2%, 50ml (as Hydrochloride)	200	vial	7,220.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
38	Lidocaine 2%, 1.8ml with epinephrine capsule	300	carule	4,620.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
39	Magnesium Sulfate 250mg/ml, 20ml	1000	amp/vial	28,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
40	Mefenamic Acid 500mg	10000	tab/cap	6,200.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
41	Metformin 500mg	5000	tab/cap	4,900.00	4,500.00	4,150.00	4,000.00
42	Metronidazole 125mg/5ml, suspension, 60ml, as benzoate	100	bottle	1,650.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
43	Metronidazole 5mg/ml, 100ml	1500	amp/vial	24,930.00	NO BID	18,960.00	NO BID
44	Montelukast Sodium 10mg	500	tab/cap	4,675.00	NO BID	NO BID	2,250.00
45	Omeprazole 40mg	500	tab/cap	5,020.00	NO BID	1,670.00	2,900.00
46	Oxacillin 500mg	1000	amp/vial	20,770.00	20,000.00	NO BID	NO BID
47	PIPERACILLIN, 4g + 500mg tazobactam	3000	vial	323,400.00	NO BID	313,290.00	NO BID
48	Paracetamol 250mg/5ml, 60ml syrup	200	bottle	2,834.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
49	Paracetamol 100mg/ml, 15ml drops	150	bottle	1,975.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
50	Spironolactone 25mg	300	tab/cap	3,267.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
51	SODIUM BICARBONATE 650mg	300	tab/cap	393.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
52	SODIUM BICARBONATE, 1 mEq/ml, 50ml	100	amp/vial	9,075.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
53	SODIUM CHLORIDE 2.5mEq/mL, 20ml	200	amp/vial	6,160.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
54	TERBUTALINE Sulfate, 500mcg/ml, 1ml	100	amp/vial	4,545.00	NO BID	BEYOND ABC	NO BID
55	TETANUS TOXOID, 0.5ml	1500	amp/vial	52,995.00	NO BID	46,335.00	NO BID
56	TRANEXAMIC ACID, 500mg	500	tab/cap	2,750.00	NO BID	NO BID	2,100.00
57	TRAMADOL, 50mg/ml, 2ml, as Hydrochloride	2000	amp/vial	14,100.00	NO BID	13,960.00	NO BID





Republic of the Philippines  
Department of Health-Metro Manila Center for Health Development  
**SAN LORENZO RUIZ WOMEN'S HOSPITAL**  
O. Reyes St., Santulan, Malabon City  
Tel. No. (02) 294-4853 / 294-4854 Website: www.slrwh.doh.gov.ph  
PHHealth Accredited Facility



58	1 KAMADOOL HCl 50mg	500	tab/cap	1,080.00	1,000.00	NO BID	575.00
59	VANCOMYCIN, 1g (as Hydrochloride)	100	amp/vial	23,100.00	22,800.00	NO BID	NO BID
60	Atracurium besylate, 10mg/ml, 2.5ml	30	amp/vial	2,623.50	NO BID	2,593.50	NO BID
61	Ceftriaxone, 1g vial + 10ml diluent (IV)	2000	amp/vial	40,600.00	NO BID	38,640.00	NO BID
62	Ferrous Sulfate + Folic Acid 60mg elemental iron + 400mcg Folic acid	5000	tab/cap	4,000.00	NO BID	3,450.00	NO BID
63	Morphine sulfate 10mg/ml, 1ml	300	amp/vial	28,255.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
64	Milidacolum 1mg/ml, 5ml	3000	amp/vial	273,240.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
65	Diclofenac sodium, 25mg/ml, 3ml	1000	amp/vial	18,570.00	NO BID	16,220.00	15,650.00
66	Hyoscine-N-Butyl Bromide, 20mg/ml, 3ml	3000	amp/vial	86,850.00	NO BID	47,940.00	76,800.00
67	Niphenhydramine HCl, 50mg/ml, 1ml	1000	amp/vial	30,170.00	NO BID	19,740.00	28,450.00
68	Dupamine HCl, 40mg/ml, 5ml	300	amp/vial	17,762.00	12,600.00	12,594.00	NO BID
69	POTASSIUM CHLORIDE, 2mEq/ml, 20ml	300	amp/vial	7,920.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
70	PHYTOMENADIONE, 10mg/ml, 1ml	300	amp/vial	5,649.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
71	PROPOFOL, 10mg/ml, 20ml	400	amp/vial	26,228.00	NO BID	25,496.00	NO BID
72	Epinephrine (adrenaline), 1mg/ml, 1ml	500	amp/vial	16,350.00	15,500.00	8,445.00	NO BID
73	Fluticasone 250mcg + Salmeterol 25mcg x 120 doses	50	Metered Dose Inhaler	21,450.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
74	Fluticasone 250mcg + Salmeterol 50mcg x 60 doses	50	Dry Powder Inhaler	38,628.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
75	Loratadine 10mg	1000	tab/cap	2,000.00	NO BID	1,890.00	1,850.00
76	Metoclopramide 5mg/ml, 2ml	1500	amp/vial	5,145.00	NO BID	BEYOND ABC	NO BID
77	ROSUVASTATIN, 10mg	500	tab/cap	2,320.00	2,250.00	NO BID	NO BID
78	ROSUVASTATIN, 20mg	500	tab/cap	4,545.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
79	SALBUTAMOL, Respiratory Solution: 1mg/ml, 2.5ml (unit dose)	3,000	nebule	16,020.00	NO BID	15,840.00	NO BID
80	Ipratropium + Salbutamol 500mcg + 2.5 mg x 2.5ml (unit dose) respiratory solution	15000	nebule	156,750.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID



Republic of the Philippines  
Department of Health-Metro Manila Center for Health Development  
**SAN LORENZO RUIZ WOMEN'S HOSPITAL**  
O. Reyes St., Santulan, Malabon City  
Tel. No. (02) 294-4853 / 294-4854 Website: www.slwrh.doh.gov.ph  
PHHealth Accredited Facility



81	POTASSIUM Chloride, 600mg	500	tab/cap	7,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
82	Suxamethonium Chloride (succinylcholine) 20mg/ml, 10ml	30	amp/vial	4,447.20	NO BID	4,256.70	NO BID
83	Isosorbide 5-mononitrate, 30mg MR	300	tab/cap	3,696.00	3,600.00	NO BID	NO BID
84	Isosorbide 5-mononitrate, 60mg MR	300	tab/cap	2,046.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
85	Bupivacaine heavy, 0.5%, 4ml spinal with 8% dextrose, as HCl	2000	amp/vial	258,360.00	NO BID	252,660.00	NO BID
86	Clonidine 75mcg	1000	tab/cap	8,800.00	NO BID	7,950.00	NO BID
87	Methyldopa 250mg	1500	tab/cap	16,050.00	NO BID	NO BID	10,050.00
88	Cloxacillin 500mg	2000	tab/cap	5,560.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

WHEREAS, attached is the Post Qualification and Bid Evaluation of TWG.

WHEREAS, APPLIED PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTION INC. was the lowest calculated Responsive bidder (LCRB) for item nos. 21,46,58,59,77,83.

WHEREAS, PHIL. PHARMAWEALTH INC. was the lowest calculated Responsive bidder (LCRB) for item nos. 1,11,15,17,23,36,43,45,47,55,57,60,61,62,65,67,68,71,72,79,82,86.

WHEREAS, FILADAMS PHARMA INC. was the lowest calculated Responsive bidder (LCRB) for item nos. 12,24,41,66,75.

WHEREAS, NO BID for Item nos. 2,3,4,5,6,8,10,13,14,16,18,19,22,25,26,28,29,31,32,33,34,35,37,38,39,40,42,48,49,50,51,52,53,63,64,69,70,73,74,78,80,81,84,88.

WHEREAS, Item no. 20 and 97 certificate of product registration (CPR) are expired.

WHEREAS, No certificate of product registration for Item no 27,44,56.

WHEREAS, Item no. 30 specification is unmet and was rated Non-Complying

WHEREAS, Item no. 7,9,54,76 were beyond ABC

WHEREAS Bidder's bid for item no. 85 (Bupivacaine heavy, 0.5%, 4ml spinal with 8% dextrose, as HCL) "Senpivac". The End-user submitted justification letter rejecting the product for the reason that using such brand may cause adverse effect, there was still sensory (cold sensation) despite motor block establish, the patient was given sedative to commence surgery. on opening the ampoule there is uneven edges notice and small debris from the cut tip fall inside and mix with the anesthetic, short duration of effect and retapping which in the end may not be cost-effective, the Technical Working Group (TWG) recommended to the HBAC failure of bidding for this item.

NOW, THEREFORE, after careful review and deliberation the Bids and Awards Committee of San Lorenzo Ruiz Women's Hospital, hereby RESOLVES, as it is hereby RESOLVED the **PROCUREMENT OF VARIOUS DRUGS AND MEDICINES IN 2019-008**



Republic of the Philippines  
Department of Health-Metro Manila Center for Health Development  
**SAN LORENZO RUIZ WOMEN'S HOSPITAL**  
O. Reyes St., Santulan, Malabon City  
Tel. No. (02) 294-4853 / 294-4854 Website: www.slwh.doh.gov.ph  
MnHealth Accredited Facility




**RESOLVED FURTHER THAT:**


1. To award item nos. 21,46,58,59,77,83 to **APPLIED PHARMACEUTICAL DISTRIBUTION INC.** as the lowest calculated Responsive bidder (LCRB) with the total amount of **Php 93,150.00.**
2. To award item nos. 1,11,15,17,23,36,43,45,47,55,57,60,61,62,65,67,68,71,72,79,82,86 to **PHIL. PHARMAWEALTH INC.** as the lowest calculated Responsive bidder (LCRB) with the total amount of **Php 702,137.20.**
3. To award item nos. 12,24,41,66,75 to **FILADAMS PHARMA INC** as the lowest calculated Responsive bidder (LCRB) with the total amount of **Php 103,400.00.**

Failure of bidding for item nos.

2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9,10,13,14,16,18,19,20,22,25,26,27,28,29,30,31,32,33,34,35,37,38,39,40,42,44,48,49,50,51,52,53,54,56,63,64,69,70,73,74,76,78,80,81,84,85,87,88


**RESOLVED** this 28 day of August - 2019 at the San Lorenzo Ruiz Women's Hospital, O. Reyes St., Santulan, Malabon City.


  
**MARC APOLLON R. MALVEDA, MD**  
BAC Vice-Chairperson

  
**CAROLE I. BAGUE, MD**  
BAC Member

  
**JOY A. MONTECINO, MD**  
BAC Member

  
**LEONORA S. DESTACAMENTO, RN**  
BAC Member

  
**NOEL D. VALDERRAMA, MD**  
BAC Chairperson

Approved by:  
  
**MARILOU T. NEPU, MD, DPPS, MPH**  
Medical Center Chief  
Approved on: 8/28/19