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BAC RESOLUTION
No. 2019-032

o

L]

WHEREAS, pursuant to Purchase Request No. 2019-01-0016A a Public bidding for the Procurement of various Drugs and Medicines
(1B 2019-001) was conducted in accordance with the RA 9184 and its IRR;

WHEREAS, the Invitation to Bid (IB) was advertised and posted in the PHILGEPS website for the period of January 10,2019 to January
28,2019 with Reference No. 5950007;

WHEREAS, a Pre-Bid Conference was held on January 15,2019, 10:00 am at the Training Room of San Lorenzo Ruiz Women'’s
Hospital with three (3) prospective bidders attended namely ZYRE PHARMACEUTICAL CORPORATION, ENDURE MEDICAL
INC., ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE, and MEDETHIX INCORPORATED;

WHEREAS, deadline of submission and opening of bids is on January 28, 2019, 10:00 am at SLRWH Training room and Two (2)
prospective bidder procured the bidding documents, All Prospective bidder submitted their respective proposal namely ZYRE
PHARMACEUTICAL CORPORATION, ENDURE MEDICAL INC., ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL
MERCHANDISE, and MEDETHIX INCORPORATED;

WHEREAS, the first envelope containing the eligibility and Technical Documents were individually opened. The presence, ‘
completeness and correctness of the required documents were checked and verified by the HBAC in the presence of the prospective
bidders representative after which, all bidders were declared “ELIGIBLE”; -

WHEREAS, the second envelope, containing the Financial Documents was opened, the presence, completeness and correctness of
all the documents were checked and verified by the HBAC, upon examination, all eligible bidder are rated “PASSED”.

Subsequently, their bid proposal was read and posted in the Abstract of Bids;

Name of Company ZYRE ENDURE MEDICAL ONICARE PHARMA MEDETHIX
PHARMACEUTICAL INC TRADING & GENERAL INCORPORATED
CORPORATION MERCHANDISE
BIDSECURITY Bid Securing Bid Securing Bid Securing Bid Securing
Amount Declaration Declaration Declaration Declaration
Validity
Remarks ELIGIBLE AND ELIGIBLE AND ELIGIBLE AND PASSED ELIGIBLE AND
PASSED PASSED . PASSED
Item Descrip : Quantity Unit ABC
Acetyicysteine, 200mg 300 sachet 3,057.00 NO BID BEYOND ABC NO BID NO BID
Acetylcysteine 600mg effervescent 5000 effervescent 138,700.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
tablet
3 Aluminum Hydroxide+ Mg Hydroxide, 100 bottle 3,079.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
225mg+200mg/ 5ml, 120ml suspension
4 Amino Acid for infant 6%, 100mL 30 amp/vial 12,705.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 Amoxicillin, 500mg 6000 tab/cap 7,920.00 NO BID BEYOND ABC NO BID NO BID
6 Amoxicillin, 250mg/5ml, granules/powder 100 bottle 1,788.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
for suspension, 60ml|
P Ampicillin_sodium, 500mg 5000 amp/vial 43,650.00 NO BID BEYOND ABC NO BID NO BID
8 Ampicillin 500mg+sulbactam 250mg (as 100 vial 2,474.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
sodium salt)
9 Amlodipine (as besylate), 5mg 5000 tab/cap 2,700.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID " NOBID
10 Amikacin, 50mg/ml, 2m| 500 amp/vial 11,945.00 NO BID 11,490.00 NOBID NO BID
11 Atropine sulfate, Img/mi, 1ml 100 amp/vial 762.00 NO BID BEYOND ABC NO BID NO BID
12 Ascorbic acid, 500mg 1000 tab/cap 680.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 Aspirin , 80mg 1500 tab/cap 1,290.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
14 Anti Tetanus, Serum (ATS ),1500 |U/0.7ml- 2000 amp/vial 160,820.00 NO BID 106,880.00 150,000.00 NO BID
with required temperature
15 Atorvastatin 40mg 3000 tab/cap 41,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 Azithromycin, 500mg 1000 tab/cap 15,380.00 NO BID 14,380.00 NO BID NO BID
17 Betahistine 8mg 500 tab/cap 6,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 Bisacodyl, 10mg adult suppository-with 2,500 suppository 51,950.00 NO BID 49,675.00 NO BID NO BID
required temperature
19 BUDESONIDE 250mcg/ml, 2ml unit dose 2000 nebule 58,720.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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20 Bupivacaine local, 0.5%, 10ml 250 amp/vial 26,392.50 NO BID 25,847.50 NO BID NO BID
2 Butorphanol 2mg/ml,1ml 300 amp/vial 132,000.00 132,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Calcium Gluconate, 10%, 10ml 200 amp/vial 3,520.00 NO BID 3,286.00 NO BID NO BID
23 Carboprost 250mcg/1mL sol for injection 500 amp/vial 5 195,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 187,500.00
24 Carvedilol, 6.25mg 1000 tab/cap d 1,470.00 NO BID 1,380.00 NO BID NO BID
25 Cefalexin, 500mg 2500 tab/cap 5,675.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
26 Cefazolin, 1g 1000 amp/vial 20,230.00 NO BID 19,780.00 NO BID NO BID
27 Ceftazidime, 1g 300 amp/vial 11,712.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
28 Cefotaxime 500mg 100 amp/vial 5,212.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
29 Cefuroxime 500mg 10,000 tab/cap 99,000.00 NO BID BEYOND ABC NOBID NO BID
30 Cefuroxime 750mg 5000 vial 94,550.00 NO BID 93,900.00 NO BID NO BID
31 Cefuroxime 125mg/5ml, granules for 50 bottle 9,432.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
suspension, 70ml (as axetil)
32 Cetirizine 5mg/5ml syrup, 30ml 100 bottle 7,095.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 Cetirizine 10mg 500 tab/cap 240.00 NO BID 210.00 NO BID NO BID
34 Cinnarizine 25mg tab 2000 tab/cap 2,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 Ciprofloxacin 500mg 1000 tab/cap 1,390.00 NO BID BEYOND ABC NO BID NO BID
36 Co-Amoxiclav ( Amoxicillin + Potassium 3000 tab/cap 26,130.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Clavulanate ) 500mg+ 125mg
37 Co-Amoxiclav ( Amoxicillin + Potassium 50 bottle 9,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Clavulanate ) 400mg+ 57mg/5ml, 70mL
suspension
38 Clopidogrel 75mg 2000 tab/cap 4,160.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 Clindamycin 300mg 500 tab/cap 2,890.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
40 Dobutamine 50mg/ml, 5Sml| 30 amp/vial 5,098.50 NOBID = NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 Doxycycline 100mg 500 tab/cap 525.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Digoxin 250mcg/ml, 2ml 100 amp/vial 12,491.00 NO BID 11,888.00 NO BID NO BID
a3 Dexamethasone 4mg/ml, 2ml as sodium 2000 amp/vial 55,500.00 NO BID NO BID 44,000.00 NO BID
phosphate
a4 Domperidone 1mg/ml, 60ml suspension 20 bottle 2,354.00 NO BID NO BID 2,300.00- NO BID
45 Enoxaparin 100mg /ml, 0.6 ml-with 100 pre-filled 32,080.00 NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID
required temperature syringe
46 Ephedrine sulfate, 50mg/ml, 1ml-with S4 300 amp/vial 20,049.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
a7 Epoetin alfa (recombinant human 50 pre-filled 20,466.00 NO BID 19,483.00 NO BID NO BID
erythropoietin) 4000 IU/0.4 mi, pre-filled syringe
syringe-with required temperature
48 Folic Acid 5Smg 500 tab/cap 1,705.00 NO BID NO BID 1,600.00 NO BID
a9 Furosemide 10mg/ml, 2ml 1000 amp/vial 7,140.00 NO BID 6,980.00 7,000.00 NO BID
50 Fondaparinux 2.5mg/0.5ml solution-with 30 pre-filled 38,068.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
required temperature syringe
51 Heparin ( as sodium ), 1000 iu/ml, Sml 30 amp/vial 1,895.70 NO BID 1,286.40 NO BID NO BID
52 Hydralazine 20mg/ml, 1ml 500 amp/vial 34,890.00 NO BID 29,385.00 NO BID NO BID
53 Hyoscine-N-Butyl Bromide 10mg 300 tab/cap 1,707.00 NO BID 1,434.00 NO BID NO BID
54 Hydrocortisone, 100mg (as sodium 3000 amp/vial 72,030.00 NO BID 67,320.00 NO BID NO BID
succinate) i
55 Iron Sucrose 20mg/mL, 5mL with required 500 amp/vial 70,110.00 NO BID 48,220.00 NO BID 69,940.00
temperature
56 Isosorbide Dinitrate_1mg/ml, 10m| 200 amp/vial 90,368.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
57 Isoxsuprine HCL 5mg/ml, 2ml 2000 amp/vial 324,320.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 320,000.00
58 Insulin, Biphasic Isophane Human Insulin 100 amp/vial 17,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
70/30 (recombinant DNA) 70% isophane 5
suspension + 30% soluble insulin 1001U/ml,
10ml-with required temperature
59 Insulin Regular, Recombinant DNA, Human 100 amp/vial 17,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
100 IU/ml, 10ml-with required temperature
60 Isoxsuprine HCL 10mg 1000 tab/cap 4,660.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
61 Ketamine HCL 50mg/ml, 10ml 50 amp/vial 30,167.50 NO BID 29,933.00 NO BID NO BID
62 Ketorolac 30mg/ml, 1ml| 2500 amp/vial 44,300.00 NO BID BEYOND ABC NO BID NO BID
63 Lidocaine 2%, 50ml (as Hydrochloride) 100 vial 3,960.00 NO BID NO BID 3,920.00 NO BID
64 Lidocaine 2%, 1.8ml with epinephrine 100 carpule 1,540.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
carpule
65 Losartan as Potassium salt, 50mg 1000 tab/cap 900.00 NO BID BEYOND ABC NO BID NO BID
66 Magnesium Sulfate 250mg/m|, 20ml, 500 amp/vial 14,515.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
67 Mefenamic Acid 500mg 5000 tab/cap 3,100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
68 Metformin 500mg 5000 tab/cap 4,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
69 Methylergometrine Maleate 200mcg/ml, 300 amp/vial 3,759.00 NO BID 3,594.00 NO BID NO BID
1ml
70 Metronidazole 5mg/ml, 100ml 700 amp/vial 11,634.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
71 Metronidazole 125mg/5ml, suspension, 100 bottle 1,650.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
60ml, as benzoate
72 Meropenem 1g powder 1000 amp/vial 192,690.00 NO BID 187,220.00 NO BID NO BID
73 Montelukast Sodium 10mg 300 tab/cap 2,805.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
74 Multivitamins for adults 2000 tab/cap 4,380.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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75 Mupirocin 2%, 58 300 tube ’ 18,657.00 NO BID 16,299.00 NO BID NO BID
76 Nicardipine HCL 1mg/ml, 10ml 350 amp/vial 147,392.00 NO BID 34,415.50 NO BID NO BID
77 Omeprazole 20mg 500 tab/cap 505.00 NO BID 445.00 e NO BID NO BID
78 Omeprazole 40mg 500 tab/cap Y 5,020.00 NO BID NO BID 4,000.00 NO BID
79 Omeprazole 40mg vial + 10ml solvent 3,000 vial/ampule 93,120.00 NO BID 78,990.00 BEYOND ABC NO BID
80 Oxytocin 10 1U/ml, 1ml 3000 amp/vial 23,490.00 NO BID 20,940.00 NO BID NO BID
81 Oxacillin 500mg 1000 amp/vial 20,770.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 Oral Rehydration Salts (ORS 75- 300 sachet 1,404.00 NO BID 1,386.00 NO BID NO BID
replacement) 20.5 g
8 Paracetamol 150mg/ml, 2ml 3000 amp/vial 14,760.00 NO BID 11,640.00 14,400.00 NO BID
8 Paracetamol 125mg-with required 2000 suppository 39,500.00 NO BID 39,440.00 NOBID NO BID
temperature
85 Penicillin G Crystalline 1,000,000 units 150 amp/vial 861.00 NO BID 859.50 NO BID NO BID
86 Penicillin G Crystalline 5,000,000 units 100 amp/vial 1,674.00 NOBID 1,668.00 NO BID NO BID
87 PIPERACILLIN, 4g + 500mg tazobactam 2000 amp/vial 215,600.00 NO BID BEYOND ABC NO BID NO BID
88 Paracetamol 250mg/5ml, 60ml syrup 150 bottle 2,125.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
89 Paracetamol 10mg/ml, 100ml| 100 bottle 1,317.00 NO BID BEYOND ABC NO BID NO BID
90 Phenytoin 50mg/ml, 2ml 100 amp/vial 10,462.00 NO BID 9,333.00 NO BID NO BID
91 POTASSIUM CITRATE 10mEq 200 tab/cap 1,870.00 NO BID NO BID 1,820.00 NO BID
2 Spironolactone 25mg 300 tab/cap 3,267.00 NO BID NO BID 3,210.00 NO BID
93 SODIUM BICARBONATE 650mg 300 tab/cap 393.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
94 SODIUM BICARBONATE, 1 mEg/ml, 50ml 50 amp/vial 3,462.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
95 SODIUM CHLORIDE 2.5mEg/mL, 20mL 100 amp/vial 3,286.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID,
96 Sevoflurane, for inhalation, 250ml 2 vial 11,671.00 NO BID 11,086.00 NO BID NO BID
97 TERBUTALINE Sulfate, 500mcg/ml, 1mi 100 amp/vial 4,717.00 NOBID ~ NO BID NO BID NO BID
98 TETANUS TOXOID, 0.5ml-with required 1500 amp/vial 52,995.00 NO BID BEYOND ABC NO BID NO BID
temperature
29 TRIMETHAZIDINE 35mg MR 500 tab/cap 4,395.00 NO BID NO BID 4,200.00 NO BID
100 TRANEXAMICACID, 100mg/ml, 5ml, ampule 1000 amp/vial 14,620.00 NO BID 14,590.00 NO BID NO BID
101 TRANEXAMICACID, 500mg 500 tab/cap 2,750.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID - NO BID
102 TRAMADOL, 50mg/ml, 2ml, as 1000 amp/vial 7,050.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hydrochloride
103 TRAMADOL HCl 50mg 500 tab/cap 1,080.00 NO BID NO BID 1,025.00 NO BID
104 VANCOMYCIN, 1g ( as Hydrochloride) 50 amp/vial 11,550.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
105 VITAMIN B1, B6, B12, 100mg +100mg 500 amp/vial 16,405.00 NO BID NO BID 15,500.00 NO BID
+1mg, 3ml
106 Vitamin A 50,000 iu 200 tab/cap 5,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
107 ZINC 27.5mg/ml (equivalent to 10mg 100 bottle 3,850.00 NO BID 3,800.00 NO BID
elemental zinc), 15ml drops as Sulfate
Monohydrate
108 ZINC 55mg/5ml (equivalent to 20mg 100 bottle 4,290.00 NO BID 4,000.00 NO BID
elemental zinc), 60ml syrup as Sulfate
Monohydrate

WHEREAS, item nos. 2, 3 ,4,6,8,9,12,13,15,17,,19,25,27 ,28 ,31,32 ,34,36,37 ,38 ,39 ,40 ,41 ,45 ,46 ,50,56 ,58 ,59 ,60 ,64
,66 ,67,68,70,71,73,74 ,81,88,93,94,95,97,101,102,104 & 106 was rated by the Bids and Awards Committee of San Lorenzo
Ruiz Women's Hospital as failed bid for no bid received.

WHEREAS, item nos. 1, 5, 7, 11, 29, 35, 62, 65, 87, 89 & 98 was rated by the Bids and Awards Committee of San Lorenzo Ruiz
Women’s Hospital as failed bid for Beyond ABC.

WHEREAS, ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE is Lone bidder for item nos. 63,78,91,92 & 103 upon
evaluation declared Non-Complying because CPR Submitted Expired and for ltem no. 44 declared Non-complying because of
Unmeet Specification.

WHEREAS, ENDURE MEDICAL INC. is Lone bidder for item no. 47 upon evaluation declared Non-Complying because of Unmeet
Specification.

WHEREAS, item no. 21 are awarded to ZYRE PHARMACEUTICALS CORPORATION for being the Lowest Calculated and
Responsive Bidder;

WHEREAS, item nos. 10,14 ,16,18,20,22 ,24 ,26 ,30 ,33 ,42 ,49 ,51,52 ,53 ,54 ,55 ,61 ,69 ,72 ,75,76 ,77 ,79 ,80 ,82 ,83 ,84 ,85 ,86
,90,96 & 100 are awarded to ENDURE MEDICAL INC. for being the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bidder;

ISO 9001:2015 Certified

“ISO tayo..serbisyong de kalidad at siguraDOH”

Page 3 of 4



Republic of the Philippines
Department of Health-Metro Manila Center for Health Development

SAN LORENZO RUIZ WOMEN’S HOSPITAL .
O. Reyes St., Santulan, Malabon City
Tel. No. (02) 294-4853 / 294-4854 Website: www.slrwh.doh.gov.ph
PhilHealth Accredited Facility

WHEREAS, item nos. 43, 48, 99, 105, 107 & 108 are awarded to ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL MERCHANDISE

for being the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bidder;

L]

WHEREAS, item nos. 23 & 57 are awarded to MEDETH[Q INC. for being the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bidder;

NOW, THEREFORE, after careful review and deliberation the Bids and Awards Committee of San Lorenzo Ruiz Women'’s Hospital,

hereby RESOLVES, as it is hereby RESOLVED the PROCUREMENT OF VARIOUS DRUGS AND MEDICINES IB 2019-001;

RESOLVED FURTHER THAT:

1. Itemno. 21 is awarded to ZYRE PHARMACEUTICALS CORPORATION for being the Lowest Calculated and

Responsive Bidder with the total amount of Php132,000.00
™ A

2 \?n nos
|t the total amount of Php955,j4 .90 .

3. Item nos. 43, 48,99, 105, 107 & 108 are awarded to ONICARE PHARMA TRADING & GENERAL

) 46 U{o@f@ &?&2@ g\«é’ Q oy 79@0@
%'are awarded to E MEDICAL I emg e Lowest Ca culated and R

66

onsive

»

MERCHANDISE for being the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bidder with the total amount of Php73,100.00

4. Itemnos. 23 & 57 are awarded to MEDETHIX INC. for being the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bidder with

the total amount of Php507,500.00

5. Anditemnos.1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9,11,12,13,15,17, 19, 25, 27, 28, 29, 31, 32, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 44,
45, 46, 47, 50, 56, 58, 59, 60, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 70,71, 73, 74, 78, 81, 87, 88, 89,91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 97,
98, 101, 102, 103, 104 & 106 was rated by the Bids and Awards Committee as failed bid and for re-posting

and mandated the end-user to review the price and specifications.

RESOLVED this 19t day of March 2019 at the San Lorenzo Ruiz Women’s Hospital, O. Reyes St., Santulan, Malabon City.

LOUVELEE C. FLORO, MD CAROLE I. BAGUE, MD

BAC Vice-Chairperson BAC Member

JOY A. MONTECINO, MD
BAC Member

DESTACAMENTO, RN
AC Member

woved by:
) )

MARILOUT. NER:,'VD, DPPS, MPH

Chief of Hospital Il
Approved on:
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